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Introducing Feel Your Best Self 

Well-being is essential to a healthy life, but there are many parts to well-being. Well-
being includes dimensions such as physical, financial, environmental, and emotional. 
The focus of the Feel Your Best Self toolkit is about emotional well-being, meaning 
how positively you feel generally and about life overall.1 

Feel Your Best Self offers strategies to help strengthen the day-to-day experience of 
positive emotions or feelings – also known as positive affect. A higher ratio of positive to 
negative affect – 3:1, for example - can help you be more effective at managing 
thoughts and behaviors - like lowering stress, feeling more enthusiastic or energetic, or 
coping effectively with disruptions to routines. How you feel in everyday moments 
contributes to overall emotional well-being, therefore it is important to regularly practice 
simple strategies that can directly modify how you feel in the moment. Doing just a little 
on a regular basis can make it easier to experience lifts in emotion, feelings, or moods: 
meaning feeling your best self. 

When children learn strategies to help them feel their best self, the strategies that they 
find most useful can assist them throughout their lives.2 That is why we created Feel 
Your Best Self -- a toolkit designed for children ages 3 through 12 to learn strategies to 
promote emotional well- being. Feel Your Best Self is fun and engaging, incorporating 
puppetry to as a behavior- modeling and instructional tool for social-emotional 
learning.2,3 Using puppets has been shown to add benefits such as:  

● ● ● ● ●  

increased student participation3 

improved rates of peer-to-peer collaboration and communication3 

reduced student concerns related to making mistakes or providing incorrect answers3 

increased student attention and engagement3 

added layers of fun to the learning experience3,4 

Use of 
children at their developmental level and helps create a more relaxed learning 
environment to enable learning. Children may identify and empathize with puppets in 
ways that they may not with the people in their lives. For children with special needs, 
puppets can be used to model social stories and coping strategies, engage with 
students with communication differences (e.g., non-verbal), and to connect with 
students who can be more difficult for teachers to reach.3,5 
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